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Weddings

Courtney Louise Springman, daugh-
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Paul J. Springman 
(Sondra Gault) of Atlanta and Bluffton, 
SC, married Brooks Easter DuBose, son 
of Mrs. Charles Wills DuBose (Diana 
Brooks Easter) of Camden, SC, and the 
late Mr. DuBose. The ceremony took 
place in Bluffton on May 21, 2016, at 
Waterside Chapel at Palmetto Bluff.  
Dr. Chuck Roberts, pastor at Peachtree 
Presbyterian Church in Atlanta, offi-
ciated. The wedding ceremony was 
followed by a celebration at Montage Pal-
metto Bluff, with a dinner and reception 
held on the May River Lawn, and dancing 
afterwards in the Oak Ballroom.  

The bride is the granddaughter of the 
late Mr. and Mrs. James Gault Jr. of Bell-
wood, PA. She is also the granddaughter 
of the late Mr. and Mrs. Gervase Spring-
man of Altoona, PA.

The groom is the grandson of the late 
Mr. and Mrs. Donald W. Easter (Virginia 
C. Follett) of Lake Forest, IL, and Char-
lottesville, VA. He is also the grandson 
of the late Mr. and Mrs. Charles Perkins 
DuBose Jr. (Edith Wills) of Camden.

The bride wore an Oscar de la Renta 
gown and a cathedral length veil, also 
worn by her sister when she married. She 
carried a bouquet of pink peonies, along 
with her grandmother’s handkerchief. 
The bride’s sister, Brooke Springman 
Brennan, was matron of honor, with Miss 
Edith Wills DuBose, the groom’s sister, 
standing as maid of honor. The groom’s 
cousin, Douglas Follett Easter, served as 
best man. The ceremony and reception 
music was provided by Equinox Orches-
tra of Savannah, with the Right on Band 
of Virginia Beach performing afterwards 

in the ballroom.
Mrs. DuBose is a graduate of the Uni-

versity of Virginia. She also received a 
master’s degree from Emory University. 

Mr. DuBose is a graduate of Hamp-
den-Sydney College.

The couple took a wedding trip to Italy 
and make their home in Charleston, SC.
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